Pleasanton Unified School District

Picnic Tables and Outdoor Benches Bid 2014-15.03B

BID SUMMARY

ITEM #

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION (BRAND/MODEL BID)

O'KEEFE

TOTAL

DIVERSIFIED METAL

TOTAL

60

46" SQUARE PICNIC TABLE, BENCHES ON 4
SIDES. WABASH VALLEY SIGNATURE
#5G140D OR EQUIVALENT

44,422.80

35,857.20

10

6' LONG RECTANGULAR PICNIC TABLE, 2
BENCHES, WITH UMBRELLA HOLE, WABASH
VALLEY SIGNATURE #5G106DM OR
EQUIVALENT

7,402.20

5,627.40

20

8' LONG RECTANGULAR PICNIC TABLE, 2
BENCHES, WABASH VALLEY SIGNATURE
#5G111D OR EQUIVALENT.

15,864.00

12,344.80

REPLACEMENT SEAT, BACK, AND HARDWARE
FOR WABASH VALLEY #SG318D BENCH. 8'
IN LENGTH.

1,575.85

1,255.00
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Pleasanton Unified School District

Picnic Tables and Outdoor Benches Bid 2014-15.03B

BID SUMMARY

ITEM #

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION (BRAND/MODEL BID)

O'KEEFE

TOTAL

DIVERSIFIED METAL

TOTAL

6' BENCH NO BACK, SURFACE MOUNT, 10"
SEATS. WABASH VALLEY SIGNATURE
#SD307D OR EQUIVALENT

224.38

242.71

46" OCTAGON REPLACEMENT TOP AND
HARDWARE PACK FOR WABASH SIGNATURE
#5G145D TABLE

1,257.30

1,440.30

46" SQUARE REPLACEMENT TOP FOR
WABASH VALLEY SIGNATURE #5G140D
TABLE

1,251.05

1,473.60

10' BACKLESS BENCH WITH 10" WIDE SEATS,
IN GROUND MOUNT. WABASH VALLEY
SIGNATURE #5G328D OR EQUIVALENT.

366.80

303.75
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Pleasanton Unified School District

Picnic Tables and Outdoor Benches Bid 2014-15.03B

BID SUMMARY

O'KEEFE

TOTAL

DIVERSIFIED METAL

TOTAL

46" SQUARE TABLE WITH 4 SEATS, SQUARE
PERFORATIONS. WABASH URBANSCAPE
PORTAGE #PODP51C OR EQUIVALENT

1,081.04

No Bid

10

15

UMBRELLA, GARDEN-STYLE, 7.5' DIAMETER,
CRANK LIFT, MINIMUM 80% SUN BLOCKAGE
FABRIC. WABASH VALLEY #UM100 OR
EQUIVALENT

2,632.20

No Bid

11

6' REPLACEMENT BENCH TOP WITH
HARDWARE PACK FOR WABASH DESIGNER
#DS307T, SLAT, OR EQUIVALENT

942.93

No Bid

12

8' REPLACEMENT BENCH TOP WITH
HARDWARE PACK FOR WABASH DESIGNER
#DS312T, SLAT, OR EQUIVALENT

1,485.24

No Bid
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Pleasanton Unified School District
Picnic Tables and Outdoor Benches Bid 2014-15.03B

BID SUMMARY

SECTION 3--DISCOUNTS--BIDDERS MAY LIST PERCENT DISCOUNTS FROM THEIR CURRENT,
GENERAL PUBLISHED COMPONENT PRICING CATALOG FOR PICNIC TABLES AND BENCHES
OR SPECIFIED CATALOGS FOR THEIR FULL INE OF PRODUCTS, IF THEY WISH. THE DISTRICT

% DISCOUNT

OFFERED BY
DAVID F % DISCOUNT
O'KEEFE OFFERED BY
MANUFACTURER SUBMITTED COMPANY DIVERSIFIED METAL
WABASH 5%
URBANSCAPE 5%

DIVERSIFIED METAL FABRICATORS, INC.

10%
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