

**BID MATRIX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



**VENDORS:**

**CHEF TOYS**

**RESTAURANT  
DEPOT**

ITEMS #	Manufacturer	Description	Model		
1a.	Beverage Air	School Milk Cooler, Single Access Forced Air, 49" Stainless Steel	SMF49Y-1-S	2,580.24 (+ \$75 Rebate) 4-5 Weeks	2,721.00
1b.	Alternate: Traulesen	Milk Cooler, Forced Air, Single Access	RMC49S6	2,466.80 4-5 weeks	3,742.00
2a.	Beverage Air	School Milk Cooler, Single Access Forced Air, 58" Stainless Steel	SMF58	2,882.13 4-5 weeks	3,057.00
2b.	Alternate: Traulesen	Milk Cooler, Forced Air, Single Access	RMC58S6	2,770.75 4-5 weeks	4,203.00
3.	Beverage Air Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
4.	Blodgett Oven Co.	Full Size Bakery Deth Dual Flow Gas Convection Bakery Oven	DFG-20-ES DBL	13,241.84 (+\$1,000 Rebate) 4-5 weeks (*Energy Star brand - rebate offered at time of purchase)	12,389.00
5.	Blodgett Oven Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
6.	Crescor	Retherm Basket Oven 208V/60/1- PH	RO-151-F-1332D	7,966.85 6-8 weeks	9,148.00
7.	Crescor	Retherm Basket Oven 208V/60/3- PH	RO-151-F-1332D	7,966.85 5-6 weeks	9,148.00
8.	Crescor	Insulated Stainless Steel Super Duty Hot Cabinet Series (Heated Mobile Cabinet)	H-137-SUA-12D-SD	4,376.58 (+300 Rebate) 5-6 weeks (*rebate offered by SCE after purchased)	4,977.00
9.	Crescor Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
10.	G.A. Systems	Heated Cabinet, 63"	H5	6,078.78 9-12 weeks	6,778.00
11.	G.A. Systems	Heated Elementary Cabinet, 63"	EH5	5,749.46 9-12 weeks	6,419.00
12.	G.A. Systems	Refrigerated Cabinet, 63"	C5	6,488.34 9-12 weeks	7,243.00
13.	G.A. Systems	Refrigerated Elementary Cabinet	EC5	6,488.34 9-12 weeks	7,243.00
14.	G.A. Systems	Heated Cabinet, 76"	H6	6,713.20 9-12 weeks	7,494.00


**BID MATRIX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



				<b>VENDORS:</b>	<b>CHEF TOYS</b>	<b>RESTAURANT DEPOT</b>
<b>ITEMS #</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Model</b>			
15.	G.A. Systems	Heated Elementary Cabinet, 76"	EH6		6,713.20 9-12 weeks	7,494.00
16.	G.A. Systems	Refrigerated Cabinet, 76"	C6		7,137.16 9-12 weeks	7,698.00
17.	G.A. Systems	Refrigerated Elementary Cabinet, 76"	EC6		7,137.16 9-12 weeks	7,798.00
18.	G.A. Systems	Sneeze Guard (DBL Sided) 63" x 34.5" x 20.25"	C0211-DSN63		1,220.86 9-12 weeks	1,481.00
19.	G.A. Systems	Lid Storage Cart	LC30 (C0391)		751.61 9-12 weeks	911.00
20.	G.A. System Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
21.	Montague Company	6-Open Burner Range w/Oven (on casters)	136-5		6,888.96 6-8 weeks	6,599.00 4 weeks
22.	Montague Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
23.	Rational	Combi Oven (Full Size Roll-In)	A228306.19E		39,258.88 (+750 Rebate) 5-6 weeks (*Energy Star brand - rebate offered at time of purchase)	42,925.00
24.	Everpure	Water Filtration Unit	EV9797-22		472.03	639.00
25.	Rational Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
26.	Everpure Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
27.	Panasonic	Commercial Microwave Oven (Sonic Steamer) 3200 Watt*	NE-3280		3,498.60	3,189 3 weeks
28.	Panasonic	Commercial Microwave Oven, 1200 Watt*	NE-12521		685.98 4-5 weeks	688.00
29.	Panasonic Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
30.	Traulsen	Reach-In Refrigerator, Full Length Door (one door), Stainless Steel	AHT132NUT-FHS		5,902.26	5,734 4 weeks
31.	Traulsen	Roll-In Refrigerator, 2 Sections	2R1232HUT-FHS		8,718.05 5-6 weeks	8,811.00
32.	Traulsen Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
33.	True	Reach-In Solid Swing Door Freezer (one door), Stainless Steel	STA1F-1S		4,363.89	3,972 3 weeks
34.	TRUE	Reach-In Solid Swing Door Freezer (two door), Stainless Steel	STA2F-2S		5,989.03 (+ \$300 Rebate) *rebate offered by SCE after purchase	5,469 3 weeks

**BID MATRIX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



				VENDORS:	CHEF TOYS	RESTAURANT DEPOT
ITEMS #	Manufacturer	Description	Model			
35.	TRUE	Reach-In Solid Swing Door Freezer (two door), 49 Cu. Ft., Stainless Steel	STA2R-2S	4,642.18 (+ \$125 Rebate) *rebate offered by SCE after purchase	4,229 3 weeks	
36.	True Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
37.	Vulcan	60" Restaurant Range w/Oven (Mobile)	60SC-6B24GN	9,383.72	9,040 4 weeks	
38.	Vulcan	60" Restaurant Range w/Oven (on Curb)	60SC-6B24GN	11,618.02	10,757 4 weeks	
39.	Vulcan Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
40.	MARS	Air Curtain	N278-2UA-BG	963.72 (4/5 wks)	1,199.00	
41.	MARS	Air Curtain	NH236-1UA-BG	719.88 (4/5 wks)	949.00	
42.	MARS	Air Curtain	N248-1UA-BG	534.26 (4/5 wks)	699.00	
43.	MARS Cat. Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
44.	SAMMONS	Mobile Transport Cart	9150-13	-----	-----	
45.	CRESCOR	Heated Transport Cart	H-137-SUA-12D-D	-----	-----	
46.	Sammons Cat. Disc.	N/A	N/A	-----	-----	
47.	Ameripak	Conveyor Extensions	Dual Putch	No Bid	No Bid	
48.	Ameripak	Conveyor Extensions	Dual Putch	9,641.50 7-8 weeks	No Bid	
49.	Ameripak Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
50.	NILMA	Dolly w/Basket Accessory		2,360 4-5 weeks	No Bid	
51.	NILMA Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
52.	Robot Coupe	Combination Vegetable Prep & VerticalCutter-Mixer	R502	3,047.88 3-4 weeks	3,783.00	
53.	Robot Coupe Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
54.	PITCO Frialator	Fryer Assembly (Mobile)**	SSH55R-SSTC-S	5,130.60 6-8 weeks	5,307 (4 wks)	
55.	PITCO Frialator	Drain Cabinet**	BNB-SSH55	1,057.71	710.00 (4 wks)	
**Above 2 items must be ordered together			Total Bid:	6,188.31	6,017.00	
56.	PITCO Frialator Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	
57.	Cleveland Range	80 Gal Tilting Kettle	KGL-80-T	25,210.25 6-8 weeks	32,342.00	
58.	Cleveland Range	80 Gal Tilting Kettle	MKGL80-T	53,048.89 6-8 weeks	67,690.00	
59.	Cleveland Range	40 Gal Tilting Skillet	SGL-40T1	14,306.68 6-8 weeks	18,346.00	

**BID MATRIX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



				<b>VENDORS:</b>	<b>CHEF TOYS</b>	<b>RESTAURANT DEPOT</b>
<b>ITEMS #</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Model</b>			
60.	Cleveland Range Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
61.	Cambro	Camshelving	36" Long		289.78 (4/5 wks)	555.00
		(Assembled)	48" Long		339.97 (4/5 wks)	525.00
		Dry Storage Shelv.	42" Long		326.24 (4/5 wks)	569.00
		Units	60" Long		434.25 (4/5 wks)	710.00
62.	Cambro	Camshelving (Assembled), Pot Storage Shelving Units	48" Long		339.97 4-5 weeks	525.00
63.	Cambro	Camshelving (Assembled), Mobile Storage Shelving Units	60" Long		533.78 4-5 weeks	725.00
64.	Cambro	Camshelving (Assembled), Mobile Pot Shelving Units	48" Long		421.66 4-5 weeks	725.00
65.	Cambro	Camshelving (Assembled)	48" Long		339.97 (4/5 wks)	525.00
		Refrigerator Shelv.	54" Long		376.26 (4/5 wks)	579.00
		Units	60" Long		434.25 (4/5 wks)	710.00
66.	Metro	Mobile Secuirty Unit Shelving (Assembled)	SEC55DC		870.47 5-6 weeks	1,199.00
67.	Cambro Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
68.	Metro Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
69.	Thunderbird	Mixing Bowl Lift, Free Standing	BL-20140		10,011.80 6-8 weeks	11,865.00
70.	Varimixer	20 Qt. Food Mixer, Planetary	W20A		3,449.82	3,424 3 weeks
71.	Globe	5 Qt. Mixer, Planetary	SP5		565.40 4-5 weeks	578.00
72.	Thunderbird Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
73.	Varimixer Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
74.	Globe Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
75.	Cambro	Mobile Ingredient Bid	1BS27148		200.00	179.00 4 weeks
76.	Spray Master	Mobile Spray Cleaning System	SMT-600-PE		2,536.82 4-5 weeks	6,899.00
77.	Spray Master Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid
78.	Metro	Mobile Roll-In Rack (Assembled)	RF13N		420.99 4-5 weeks	738.00
79.	Advance / Tabco	Mobile Soak Sink (Assembled)	9FSC-20		1,616.39 6-8 weeks	2,232.00
80.	Advance / Tabco Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A		No Bid	No Bid

**BID MATRIX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



**VENDORS:**

**CHEF TOYS**

**RESTAURANT  
DEPOT**

ITEMS #	Manufacturer	Description	Model		
81.	Cleveland Range	Ring Stand	RS	260.00 (4/5 wks)	699.00
82.	Vulcan	Cheesemelter, 36"	ICM36	2,344.79 (4/5 wks)	2,422.00
83.	Ameripak	Free Standing Table, Platinum Pkg, Side Table (Assembled)	18x60 Side Table	4,805.16 4-5 weeks	No Bid
84.	Advance/Tabco	Mobile Work Table (Assembled)	SS-306	992.28 6-8 weeks	1,282.00
85.	Advance/Tabco	Mobile Work Table (Assembled)	SS-305	996.71 6-8 weeks	1,289.00
86.	Advance/Tabco	Mobile Work Table (Assembled)	KSS-308	1,658.80 6-8 weeks	4,651.00
87.	Advance/Tabco	ADA, 34"H, Mobile Work Table (Assembled)	SS-306	1,029.85 6-8 weeks	1,339.00
88.	Aero	Mobile Work Table (Assembled)	2TG-3072	984.11 6-8 weeks	1,699.00
89.	Aero Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
90.	Globe	Scale	GPS10	101.10	89.00 (3 wks)
91.	Vulcan	Spreader Cabinet	VWT12B	2,250.87	2,399 (4 wks)
92.	NILMA	Vegetable Washer	ATIR I Tilting	35,626.45 4-5 weeks	No Bid
93.	The Platinum Packing Group	Vertical Bagger, Platinum Packing	EZ BAGGER	43,070 8-10 weeks	No Bid
94.	Platinum Pkg Grp Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
95.	<del>Lakeside Mfg.</del>	<del>Cart, Utility</del>	<del>744</del>	-----	-----
96.	Lakeside Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
97.	MARS	Air Curtain	N236-1UA-BG	541.31 (4/5 wks)	639.00
98.	Advance/Tabco	Work Table, 36" Wide Top (Assembled)	MS-366	707.64 6-8 weeks	719.00
99.	Advance/Tabco	Work Table, 36" Wide Tope	MS-364	590.07 6-8 weeks	619.00
100.		Camshelving 42" Long		326.24 (4/5 wks)	525.00
		Refrigerated Shelv. Unit 48" Long		339.97 (4/5 wks)	569.00
101.		Range, 36", 4 Burners, 12" Griddle	IR-4-G12	2,613.32 4-5 weeks	2,956.00
102.	Cambro	Camshelving, Storage Shelving Units, 4-Tier, 18"D (Assembled)	42" Long	298.01 4-5 weeks	369.00
103.	Cambro	Camshelving, Storage Shelving Units, 4-Tier, 21"D (Assembled)	48" Long	339.97 4-5 weeks	425.00

**BID MATRIX FOR:**  
**KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES**  
**BID NO. 2014/15-1**



				<b>VENDORS:</b>	<b>CHEF TOYS</b>	<b>RESTAURANT DEPOT</b>
<b>ITEMS #</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Model</b>			
104.	Imperial	Restaurant Series Spreader Cabinet, 12" Wide Top	IR-12-SPR	455.74 4-5 weeks		518.00
105.	Imperial Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid		No Bid
106.	Pitco Frialator	Soltice Pre-packaged Fryer System w/Sytem Solo Filter System Gas	1-SF-SG14C-S	9,010.75 6-8 weeks		9,800.00
107.	Platinum Packing	Mobile Work Station	Workstation FS	27,205.98 6-8 weeks		No Bid
108.	Vollrath	Utility Cart	97160	303.43 (3-4 wks)		309.00
109.	Vollrath	Utility Cart	97161	360.71 (3/4 wks)		366.00
110.	Metro	Utility Cart	MY2636-25BU	124.49 (3/4 wks)		239.00
111.	Vollrath Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid		No Bid
112.	Advance/Tabco	Multi-Wash Hand Sink	19-18-48	1,041.79 6-8 weeks		169.00 3 weeks
113.	T & S Brass	Faucet, 6" Swing Nozzle, Splash Mounted	B-1115	105.00 3-4 weeks		139.00
114.	Imperial	Salamandar Broiler, Gas, Restaurant Range Match	ISB-36	1,530.45 4-5 weeks		1,599.00
115.	RMI Refrigerator Mfg	Walk-In Refrigerator	Custom	26,000 6-8 weeks		No Bid
116.	Omnitemp	Blower Coil	OTM-11-DS-A-1	*Included w/#127		No Bid
117.	Accurex, LLC	Customer Exhaust Hood	XXDW-102-S	8,562.33 6-8 weeks		No Bid
118.	Blodgett	Double - Convection Oven	DFG200 Double	12,986.94		12,389 5 weeks
119.	T & S Brass	Kettle & Pot Faucet	B-0291	320.40 3-4 weeks		389.00
120.	Advance / Tabco	Fabricated NSF Sink, 3-Compartment	FS-3-2424-24RL	2,559.18 6-8 weeks		2,759.00
121.	Aero	Sink, Hand Wall Mount Washing Sink	HSADA-S	1,417.50		899.00 3 weeks
122.	T & S Brass	Faucet Workboard, Splash Mounted	B-1146-04	144.30 3-4 weeks		157.00
123.	T & S Brass	Easy Install Pre-Rinse Unit	B-0133-ADF14-B	325.68 3-4 weeks		369.00
124.	Custom (Per Chef Toys: Advance/Tabco)	Mobile Work Table (w/casters)	Stainless Steel (VSS-240)	670.96 6-8 weeks		No Bid
125.	Accurex, LLC	Custom Exhaust Hood	XXDW-108-S	6,935.87 6-8 weeks		No Bid
126.	Accurex, LLC	Custom Exhaust Hood	XXDW-126-S	9,445.25 6-8 weeks		No Bid

**BID MATRX FOR:  
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SUPPLIES  
BID NO. 2014/15-1**



**VENDORS:**

**CHEF TOYS**

**RESTAURANT  
DEPOT**

ITEMS #	Manufacturer	Description	Model		
127.	Omnitemp	Air Cooled Remote Refrigeration Rack & System	OTJ2-AC-H-1-0-3-4	12,080.20 6-8 weeks	No Bid
128.	Accurex Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
129.	Omnitemp Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
130.	RMI Refrigeration Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
131.	T & S Brass Catalog Discount	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid

**Note:** - Yellow highlight represents awarded items to each vendor  
 - "Catalog Discounts" refers to future kitchen equipment and/or related supplies not identified on bid  
 Bidders did not provide a discount for this category  
 - Items identified in "red" is either a "No Bid" or item was removed from bid (strikethrough)  
 - Lead time is referenced under bid amount