
Bid No. 15/16-03NS, Kitchen Equipment, Smallwares Accessories

Bid Matrix

Line # Description
Manufacturer &      

Model No.

Est. 

Qty
Action Sales

Arrow 

Restaurant 

Equipment & 

Supplies Inc.

Chefs' Toys

East Bay 

Restaurant 

Supply

Plastic 

Package, 

Inc.

Sunrise 

Packaging 

Products, 

Inc.

The 

Platinum 

Packaging 

Group

1 Aluminum Can Rack, 24 3/4 x 35 1/8 x 40 1/8
Advance Tabco                

CR10-54
4 No Bid 583.90$              446.93$             438.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2
School milk cooler, single access forced air, stainless steel, 

49"

Beverage Air                   

SMF-49Y-1-S
5

$2289             

True                          

TMC-49-5-SS

 $2865.00 1-3  

$2525.00 4+ 
2,659.64$          2,549.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3
School milk cooler, single access forced air, stainless steel, 

58"

Beverage Air                     

SMF58
5

$2571            

True                    

TMC-58-5-SS

 $3173.00 1-3  

$2839.00 4+ 
2,987.40$          2,863.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 School Milk Cooler, single access, stainless steel, 49"
Beverage Air                     

ST49N-S
6 2,574.00$          

 $2695.00 1-3  

$2425.00 4+ 
2,553.17$          2,447.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 School Milk Cooler, single access, stainless steel, 58"
Beverage Air            

ST58N-S
6 2,841.00$          

 $3005.00 1-3  

$2679.00 4+ 
2,818.65$          2,702.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6
Dual Flow Gas Convection Bakery Oven, Full Size Bakery 

Depth

Blodgett                                    

DFG-20-ES DBL
5

 $8550.00                    

DFG  200-K12-

ES-DBL 

 $14380.00  

Blodgett DFG-200-

ES-DBL 

9,153.20$          13,566.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 Quickthern rethermilization cart, single phase, 208 volt
Crescor                          

RO-151-FUA-18D
3 7,515.00$          

 $6825.00   

Crescor RO-151-

FUA-18DE 

7,816.60$          7,661.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 Quickthern rethermilization cart, three phase, 208 Volt
Crescor                                

RO-151-FUA-18D
3 7,515.00$          

 $6825.00   

Crescor RO-151-

FUA-18DE 

7,816.60$          7,661.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 Insulated Stainless Steel Super Duty Hot Cabinet, two door
Crescor                            

H-137-SUA
5 4,285.00$          

 $3625.00   

Crescor H-137-

SUA-12D-SD 

3,730.15$          3,657.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10 heated cabinet, 63"
G.A. Systems                

H5
10 6,090.00$           $           5,982.40 6,070.78$          5,927.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

11 heated elementary cabinet, 63"
G.A. Systems             

EH5
10 6,090.00$           $           5,982.40 6,070.78$          5,927.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12 refrigerated cabinet, 63"
G.A. Systems                          

C5
10 6,495.00$           $           6,393.90 6,488.35$          6,334.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

13 refrigerated elementary cabinet, 63"
G.A. Systems                

EC5
10 6,495.00$           $           6,393.90 6,488.35$          6,334.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

14 heated cabinet, 76"
G.A. Systems                            

H6
10 6,715.00$           $           6,614.65 6,712.41$          6,551.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15 heated elementary cabinet, 76"
G.A. Systems             

EH6
5 6,715.00$           $           6,614.65 6,712.41$          6,584.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

16 refrigerated cabinet, 76"
G.A. Systems                            

C6
10 7,145.00$           $           7,033.20 7,137.16$          6,964.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

17 refrigerated elementary cabinet, 76"
G.A. Systems             

EC6
5 7,145.00$           $           7,033.20 7,137.16$          6,997.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

18 stainless steel basket, 2"
G.A. Systems             

B13202S
200 66.00$                $                64.85 65.82$               65.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid 

19 stainless steel basket, 4"
G.A. Systems           

B13204S
400 72.00$                $                70.35 71.38$               69.30$          No Bid No Bid No Bid 

20 heated cabinet, 50"
G.A. Systems                  

H4
5 5,700.00$          5,618.05$           5,701.05$          5,602.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

21 heated elementary cabinet, 50"
G.A. Systems              

EH4
5 5,700.00$          5,618.05$           5,701.05$          5,602.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

22 refrigerated cabinet, 50"
G.A. Systems                

C4
5 6,120.00$          6,029.10$           6,118.20$          6,007.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

23 refrigerated elementary cabinet, 50"
G.A. Systems                         

EC4
5 6,185.00$          6,083.90$           6,173.82$          6,061.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

24 sneeze guard, double sided, accommoadate 63" cabinet
G.A. Systems                           

SN
6 1,200.00$          

 $1181.15          

GA Systems 

DSN63 

1,198.61$          1,220.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

25 sneeze guard, double sided, accommodate 50" cabinet
G.A. Systems                              

SN
2 1,130.00$          

 $1108.10            

GA System 

DSN50 

1,124.45$          1,259.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

26 sneeze guard, double sided, accommodate 76" unit
G.A. Systems                            

SN
2 1,275.00$          

 $1245.10                       

GA System 

DSN76 

1,263.50$          1,394.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

27 Freezer Cabinet
G.A. Systems                             

F3
10 5,055.00$           $           4,969.50 5,042.92$          4,931.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

28 Freezer Cabinet
G.A. Systems                 

EF3
2 5,055.00$           $           4,969.50 5,042.92$          5,064.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

29 D5 Merchandising Cabinet, 54"
G.A. Systems                  

MD54-2
10 1,175.00$          

 $4561.40          

GA System          

D5 & MD542 

4,628.82$          4,527.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

30 D4 Merchandising Cabinet, 48"
G.A. Systems                    

MD48-2
10 1,145.00$          

 $4178.75            

GA System      D4 

& MD482 

4,240.51$          4,151.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

31 Scale
Globe                             

GPS10
7 120.00$              $              120.00 85.23$               105.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

32 Utility Cart (assembled)
Metro                              

MY2636-25BU
15 No Bid  $              170.00 141.89$             152.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

33 Mobile Security Unit Shelving (assembled)
Metro                           

SEC55DC
10 No Bid  $              890.00 728.84$             693.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

34 commercial microwave oven (sonic steamer), 3200 watt
Panasonic                            

NE-3280
6 3,525.00$           $           3,430.00 3,610.53$          3,430.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

35 commercial microwave oven, 1200 watt
Panasonic                     

NE-12521
8 725.00$              $              740.00 701.05$             740.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Est. 
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Arrow 
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Chefs' Toys

East Bay 
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Packaging 
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The 
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Packaging 
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36 Bag Blower Body System with tape sealer 4300 with scoop Sunrise Packaging 5 No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,195.00$   No Bid 

37
"D-Width" Hinged Glass Door Reach-In Refrigerator/Self-

Contained, 1-Section Half Length Door Model

Traulsen                        

AHT132DUT-HHG
4 6,630.00$           $           6,595.00 6,800.40$          6,461.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

38
"N-Width" Hinged Glass Door Pass-Thru Refrigerators/Self-

Contained, 2-Section Half Length Door Model

Traulsen                    

AHT232NPUT-HHG
1 12,050.00$        11,988.00$         12,358.80$        11,742.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid 

39
"N-Width" Hinged Glass Door Reach-In Refrigerators/Self-

Contained, 2-Section Half Length Door Model

Traulsen                        

AHT232NUT-HHG
2 8,707.00$          8,660.00$           8,930.70$          8,485.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

40
"N-Width" Reach-In Freezer Models/Self-Contained,                  

2-Section Half Length Door Model

Traulsen           

ALT232NUT-HHS
2 9,193.00$          9,145.00$           9,428.40$          8,957.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

41 Utility Cart
Vollrath                         

97160
10 375.00$             

 $370.00 1-8   

$305.00 9+ 
326.56$             304.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

42 Utility Cart
Vollrath                           

971611
20 435.00$             

 $429.00 1-7  

$363.00 8+ 
388.21$             361.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 

43 Reach-in solid swing door freezer, stainless steel, one-door
TRUE                            

STA1F-1S
10 4,118.00$          

 $4785.00 1-2  

$4542.00 3+ 
4,357.70$          4,498.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

44
Reach-in solid swing door refrigerator, stainless steel,        

one-door

TRUE                                  

STA1R-1S
10 3,295.00$          

 $3858.00 1-2  

$3630.003 + 
3,485.90$          3,598.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

45 Reach-in solid swing door freezer, stainless steel, two-door
TRUE                        

STA2F-2S
5 5,666.00$          

 $6590.00 1-2  

$6245.00 3+ 
5,995.27$          6,188.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

46
Reach-in solid swing door refrigerator, stainless steel, two-

door

TRUE                        

STA2R-2S
5 4,383.00$          

 $5158.00 1-2  

$4830.00 3+ 
4,638.16$          4,787.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

47
Reach-in solid swing door refrigerator, stainless steel, three-

door

TRUE                         

STA3R-3S
3 5,533.00$          

 $6480.00 1-2  

$6100.00 3+ 
5,854.55$          6,042.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

48
Reach-in solid half swing door refrigerator, stainless steel,         

two-door

TRUE                                    

STA2R-4HS
3 4,599.00$          

 $5410.00 1-2  

$5070.00 3+ 
4,866.25$          5,022.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

49
Reach-in solid half swing door freezer, stainless steel, two-

door

TRUE                       

STA2F-4HS
3 5,907.00$          

 $6860.00 1-2  

$6510.00 3+ 
6,250.20$          6,451.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Line # Description
Manufacturer &                 

Model No.

Est. 

Qty
Action Sales

Arrow 

Restaurant 

Equipment & 

Supplies Inc.

Chefs' Toys

East Bay 

Restaurant 

Supply

Plastic 

Package, 

Inc.

Sunrise 

Packaging 

Products, 

Inc.

The 

Platinum 

Packaging 

Group

1 Baker's Hot Pad with Wrist Strap, 10 1/2" x 8", Red
BurnGuard                                            

45913
100 10.00$               

 $12.95           

Tucker 58500 
17.09$               9.44$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Vertical Drying and Storage Rack, 24" x 60" x 75", Capacity: 

105 Trays

Cambro     

CPMU246075DRPKG 
8 797.00$              $              805.00 710.52$             746.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Angled Drying and Storage Rack, 24" x 48" x 75", Capacity: 

128 Pellets & Bases

Cambro     

CPMU244875PDPKG
8 753.00$              $              758.00 669.01$             703.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
CamSquare Food Storage Containers, 7 1/4" x 7 1/4" x 7 3/8", 

Capacity: 4 qt

Cambro                 

4SFSPP
25 3.80$                 

 $4.45           

Cambro 

4SFSPP190 

4.17$                 3.95$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
CamSquare Food Storage Containers, 8 3/8" x 8 3/8" x 7 1/4", 

Capacity: 6 qt

Cambro                        

6SFSPP                
25 4.74$                 

 $5.55                  

Cambro 

6SFSPP190 

5.18$                 4.90$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
CamSquare Food Storage Containers, 8 3/8" x 8 3/8" x 9 1/8", 

Capacity: 8 qt

Cambro                    

8SFSPP
25 5.62$                 

 $6.55                  

Cambro 

8SFSPP190 

11.77$               11.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
CamSquare Food Storage Containers, 11 1/4" x 12 1/4" x 8 

3/4", Capacity: 12 qt

Cambro                      

12SFSPP
25 7.92$                 

 $9.25            

Cambro 

12SFSPP190 

8.65$                 8.18$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Translucent, 

Capacity: Fits 2 & 4 qt

Cambro                   

SFC2SCPP
25 1.44$                 

 $1.70               

Cambro 

SFC2SCPP190 

1.57$                 1.49$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

9
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Translucent, 

Capacity: Fits 6 & 8 qt

Cambro                    

SFC6SCPP
50 1.78$                 

 $2.10             

Cambro 

SFC6SCPP190 

1.94$                 1.84$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Translucent, 

Capacity: Fits 12, 18, & 22 qt

Cambro                 

SFC12SCPP
25 2.60$                 

 $3.05               

Cambro 

SFC12SCPP190 

2.84$                 2.69$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Kelly Green, 

Capacity: Fits 2 & 4 qt

Cambro                          

SFC2
25 1.44$                 

 $1.70                

Cambro SFC2452 
1.57$                 1.49$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Winter Rose, 

Capacity: Fits 6 & 8 qt

Cambro                          

SFC6
25 1.78$                 

 $2.10          

Cambro SFC6451 
1.94$                 1.84$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Seal Covers for Camwear CamSquares, Midnight Blue, 

Capacity: Fits 12, 18, & 22 qt

Cambro                            

SFC12
25 2.60$                 

 $3.05              

Cambro 

SFC12453 

2.84$                 2.69$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 10 3/8" x 11 1/2" x 

17 1/4", Navy Blue (186), Capacity: 1 1/2 gal

Cambro                 

100LCD
5 85.70$               

 $95.25         

Cambro 

100LCD186 

100.49$             84.46$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

15
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 10 3/8" x 11 1/2" x 

17 1/4", Dark Brown (131), Capacity: 1 1/2 gal

Cambro                 

100LCD
10 85.70$               

 $95.25               

Cambro 

100LCD131 

100.49$             84.46$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

16
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 10 3/8" x 11 1/2" x 

17 1/4", Brick Red (402), Capacity: 1 1/2 gal

Cambro                 

100LCD
3 85.70$               

 $95.25               

Cambro 

100LCD402 

100.49$             84.46$          No Bid No Bid No Bid
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April 20, 2016 2



Bid No. 15/16-03NS, Kitchen Equipment, Smallwares Accessories
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Group

17
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 10 3/8" x 11 1/2" x 

17 1/4", Kentucky Green (519), Capacity: 1 1/2 gal

Cambro                 

100LCD
3 85.70$               

 $95.25        

Cambro 

100LCD519 

100.49$             84.46$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

18
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 18 

3/8", Navy Blue (186), Capacity: 2 1/2 gal

Cambro                  

250LCD
5 89.42$               

 $99.95         

Cambro 

250LCD186 

104.85$             88.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

19
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 18 

3/8", Dark Brown (131), Capacity: 2 1/2 gal

Cambro                  

250LCD
10 89.42$               

 $99.95               

Cambro 

250LCD131 

104.85$             88.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

20
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 18 

3/8", Brick Red (402), Capacity: 2 1/2 gal

Cambro                  

250LCD
5 89.42$               

 $99.95      

Cambro 

250LCD402 

104.85$             88.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 18 

3/8", Kentucky Green (519), Capacity: 2 1/2 gal

Cambro                  

250LCD
5 89.42$               

 $99.95      

Cambro 

250LCD519 

104.85$             88.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

22
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 18 

3/8", Navy Blue (186), Capacity: 4 3/4 gal

Cambro                        

500LCD
2 102.00$             

 $115.00      

Cambro 

500LCD186 

120.15$             100.98$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

23
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 24 

1/4", Dark Brown (131), Capacity: 4 3/4 gal

Cambro                        

500LCD
3 102.00$             

 $115.00      

Cambro 

500LCD131 

120.15$             100.98$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

24
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 24 

1/4", Brick Red (402), Capacity: 4 3/4 gal

Cambro                        

500LCD
2 102.00$             

 $115.00      

Cambro 

500LCD402 

120.15$             100.98$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Camtainers - Insulated Beverage Servers, 9" x 16 1/2" x 24 

1/4", Kentucky Green, Capacity: 4 3/4 gal

Cambro                        

500LCD
2 102.00$             

 $115.00      

Cambro 

500LCD519 

120.15$             100.98$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 Poly Box, 18" x 26" x 9", Translucent, Capacity: 13 gal
Cambro                    

18269P
10 22.71$               

 $24.15        

Cambro 

18269P148 

20.37$               21.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 Poly Box, 18" x 26" x 6", Translucent, Capacity: 8.75 gal
Cambro                       

18266P
10 17.97$               

 $18.50            

Cambro 

18266P148 

15.62$               16.41$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Colander, 18' x 26" x 6", Clear, Capacity: 5" deep
Cambro                                 

1826CLRCW
15 20.03$               

 $20.75    Cambro 

1826CLRCW135 
17.51$               18.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Colander, 18' x 26" x 9", Clear, Capacity: 8" deep
Cambro                      

18268CLRCW
15 33.91$               

 $35.85                 

Cambro 

18268CLRCW13

5 

30.28$               31.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

30
ColdFest Pan, GN 1/3 - 6 11/16" x 12 3/4", Black, Capacity: 

3.7 qt

Cambro                                     

36CF
5 20.96$               

 $24.30         

Cambro 36CF110 
19.66$               20.66$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

31
Camwear Rectangular Ribbed Bowls, 9" x 12 1/8", 

Polycarbonate, Capacity: 2.9 qt

Cambro                         

RSB912CW
10 6.95$                  $                  6.85 5.53$                 5.81$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

32
Camwear Rectangular Ribbed Bowls, 10 3/4" x 14 9/16", 

Polycarbonate, Capacity: 5 qt

Cambro              

RSB1014CW
10 9.70$                  $                10.00 8.08$                 8.49$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

33
Camwear Round Ribbed Bowls, 6", Polycarbonate, Capacity: 

18.8 oz

Cambro                      

RSB6CW
10 3.14$                  $                  2.50 1.99$                 2.09$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Camwear Round Ribbed Bowls, 8", Polycarbonate, Capacity: 

1.65 qt

Cambro                        

RSB8CW
10 5.16$                  $                  4.80 3.87$                 4.06$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

35
Camwear Round Ribbed Bowls, 10", Polycarbonate, 

Capacity: 3.2 qt

Cambro                          

RSB10CW
10 8.62$                  $                  8.75 7.08$                 7.44$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

36
Camwear Round Ribbed Bowls, 18", Polycarbonate, 

Capacity: 20.2 qt

Cambro                      

RSB18CW
10 24.63$                $                27.15 21.95$               23.06$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

37
Camwear Round Ribbed Bowls, 22 7/8", Polycarbonate, 

Capacity: 40 qt

Cambro                       

RSB23CW
10 36.60$                $                40.85 33.07$               34.75$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 Lugano Scallop Grip Tongs, 9", Black
Cambro                        

9TGS
48 1.82$                 

 $2.20               

Cambro 9TGS110 
1.70$                 1.52$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 Polycarbonate Measuring Cup, 32 oz, Capacity: 1 qt
Cambro                          

69930
10 6.38$                 

 $7.40       

Cambro 

100MCCW135 

5.99$                 6.29$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 Polycarbonate Measuring Cup, 64 oz, Capacity: 2 qt
Cambro                        

73845
10 8.80$                 

 $10.25           

Cambro 

200MCCW135 

8.26$                 8.68$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 Camwear Scoop, 6 oz
Cambro                                  

26929
5 3.12$                 

 $4.50                 

Cambro 

SCP6CW135 

2.93$                 3.08$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 Camwear Scoop, 24 oz
Cambro                                     

97376 
15 4.28$                 

 $5.80              

Cambro 

SCP24CW135 

4.02$                 4.22$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

43
Camwear Polycarbonate Food Pan - Full Size, 4", Capacity: 

13.7 qt

Cambro                           

14CW
6 9.67$                  $                11.95 10.08$               10.59$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

44
Camwear Polycarbonate Food Pan - Half Size Long, 4", 

Capacity: 5.3 qt

Cambro                            

24LPCW 
6 7.20$                  $                  8.90 7.50$                 7.88$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

45
Camwear Polycarbonate Food Pan - Half Size, 4", Capacity: 

6.3 qt

Cambro                   

24CW
6 5.26$                  $                  6.50 5.48$                 5.75$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

46
Camwear Polycarbonate Food Pan - Quarter Size' 4", 

Capacity: 2.7 qt

Cambro                         

44CW
6 3.78$                  $                  4.70 3.94$                 4.14$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

47
Camwear Polycarbonate Food Pan - One Sixth Size, 4", 

Capacity: 1.6 qt

Cambro                                   

60CW
6 2.64$                 

 $3.30                        

Cambro 64CW 
2.75$                 2.11$            No Bid No Bid No Bid
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48
Camwear Polycarbonate Lid - Cover with Handle, GN 1/1, 

Clear

Cambro                

10CWCH
6 6.41$                 

 $8.95            

Cambro 

10CWCH135 

6.68$                 7.02$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 Camwear Polycarbonate Lid - Flat Cover, GN 1/2 long, Clear
Cambro                    

20LPCWC 
6 4.92$                 

 $6.90        

Cambro 

20LPCWC135 

5.12$                 5.38$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

50
Camwear Polycarbonate Lid - Cover with Handle, GN 1/2, 

Clear

Cambro                 

20CWCH
6 3.35$                 

 $4.70        

Cambro 

20CWCH135 

3.49$                 3.67$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

51
Camwear Polycarbonate Lid - Cover with Handle, GN 1/4, 

Clear

Cambro                     

40CWCH 
6 2.23$                 

 $3.15                  

Cambro 

40CWCH135 

2.32$                 2.44$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

52
Camwear Polycarbonate Lid - Cover with Handle, GN 1/6, 

Clear

Cambro                        

60CWCH 
6 1.92$                 

 $2.70          

Cambro 

60CWCH135 

2.01$                 2.11$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

53 Ingredient Bin, 13" x 29 1/2" x 28", Capacity: 21 gal
Cambro                          

IBS20
3 112.92$             

 $194.00       

Cambro 

IBS20148 

163.83$             172.13$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 Ingredient Bin, 16 5/16" x 29 5/8" x 28", Capacity: 27 gal
Cambro                       

IBS27
3 119.19$             

 $199.00            

Cambro 

IBS27148 

168.20$             176.72$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

55 Ingredient Bin, 21 1/2" x 29 1/2" x 28", Capacity: 37 gal
Cambro                        

IBS37
3 181.41$             

 $215.00       

Cambro 

IBS37148 

179.13$             188.19$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

56 Camwear Scoop, Capacity: 12 oz
Cambro           

SCP12CW
3 3.38$                 

 $4.90        

Cambro 

SCP12CW135 

3.17$                 3.33$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

57 Camwear Scoop, Capacity: 24 oz
Cambro                    

SCP24CW
3 4.28$                 

 $6.25      Cambro 

SCP24CW135 
4.02$                 4.22$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

58 Digital Test Thermometer
Cooper Atkins                      

36927
50 24.00$               

 $22.35           

Cooper-Atkins 

DFP450W-0-8 

19.43$               15.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

59
20 oz Bottle with Medium Valve (NSF), 2 3/4" x 8 1/4", 

Capacity: 20 oz

FIFO                                 

35354
20 2.97$                 

 $4.65                                   

FMP 280-1808 

 $7.30         

AllPoints            

18-5672 

2.47$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

60
Opti-Squeeze Citrus Squeezers: Lemon Opti-Squeezer, 11 

1/4" x 4" x 2", Grey w/Yellow Accents

Focus Foodservice                       

8927
6 11.50$                $                14.00 

 $7.36            

Focus 

Foodservice 

8565 

3.08$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

61
Opti-Squeeze Citrus Squeezers: Lime Opti-Squeezer, 10" x 3 

1/2" x 1 7/8", Grey w/Green Accents

Focus Foodservice      

8928
6 10.35$                $                12.60 

 $6.80             

Focus 

Foodservice 

8563 

2.81$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

62
Opti-Squeeze Citrus Squeezers: Orange Opti-Squeezer, 11 

1/2" x 4 1/2" x 2 1/8", Grey w/Orange Accents

Focus Foodservice             

8929
6 14.36$                $                17.45 

$8.68                  

Focus 

Foodservice 

8566

3.93$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

63
Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls with Non-Skid Silicone Bottoms, 

8" x 3 5/8", Stainless Steel, Capacity: 2 qt

Focus Foodservice           

870SBK
6 7.15$                  $                  8.75 6.55$                 6.97$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

64
Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls with Non-Skid Silicone Bottoms, 

9 3/4" x 4 1/2", Stainless Steel, Capacity: 3 qt

Focus Foodservice               

871SBK
6 9.48$                  $                11.55 8.68$                 9.23$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

65
Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls with Non-Skid Silicone Bottoms, 

11" x 5", Stainless Steel, Capacity: 4 1/2 qt

Focus Foodservice             

872SBK
6 11.53$                $                14.05 10.55$               11.23$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

66
Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls with Non-Skid Silicone Bottoms, 

11 3/4" x 6", Stainless Steel, Capacity: 6 1/2 qt

Focus Foodservice             

873SBK
6 13.86$                $                16.85 12.69$               13.50$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

67
Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls with Non-Skid Silicone Bottoms, 

3-piece Set, Stainless Steel, Capacity: 2 qt, 3 qt, 4 1/2 qt

Focus Foodservice           

875SBK
6 26.44$                $                32.15 24.21$               25.75$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

68 Straight Edge Peeler
Good Grip                   

38637
10

 $4.38   

Victorinox 7.6075 

 $15.25                    

Hubert 38637 
2.98$                 2.18$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

69 All-Purpose Thermometer
Hubert                          

93884
100

 $2.61              

Cooper 330-0-1 

 $2.25           

Cooper-Atkins 

330-0-1 

$3.82                 

Cooper-Atkins 

330-0-4

1.41$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

70 Rosewood Handle Kitchen Utensil - Square Turner, 2" x 2"
Hubert                         

36737
25

 $6.21          

Mercer M18435 

 $10.15           

Dexter S240 

$7.80                   

Dexter S240PCP
0.87$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

71 Pizza Cutter, 4"
Hubert                         

98089
10

 $15.63         

Dexter                

P177A-PCP 

 $2.30           

Update PC-4 

$1.69               

Update PC-4
3.19$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 Silicone Pastry Brush, 7" X 1 3/10"
Hubert                      

60673
10

 $4.45             

Carlisle 4040305 
 $                  3.90 

$5.01       

Paderno     

48280-09

3.04$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 Silicone Pastry Brush, 8 1/4" X 1 7/10"
Hubert                     

53487
10

 $4.84          

Carlisle 4040505 
 $                  3.90 

$3.80             

Carlisle 4040305
3.08$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

74 Universal Bulk Dispenser, 5" X 11" X 4"
Hubert                          

33097
2

 $78.00             

Tomlinson 

1024594 

 $                70.80 No Bid 49.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid
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75 Serving Spoon, 13"
Hubert                          

34900
20

$0.61           

Update                      

B8LD-13

 $2.10        

Vollrath 4697X 

$1.26                 

Update             

CR-12SD

1.50$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

76
Color-Coded Portion Servers, 4 oz cap, Green, Capacity: 

Perforated

Hubert                         

46160
10

 $1.07            

Update SPPF-4 

 $1.35                     

Winco FPP-4 

$1.08                        

Update SPPF-4       
1.70$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

77
Color-Coded Portion Servers, 8 oz cap, Blue, Capacity: 

Perforated

Hubert                         

11820
10

 $1.43         

Update SPPF-8 

 $1.80                    

Winco FPP-8 

$1.44         

Update SPPF-8
2.28$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 Rosewood Handle Kitchen Utensil - Flexible Turner, 8" x 3"
Hubert                           

56734
5

 $13.80         

Mundial 4683M 
 $                15.25 

$10.47                   

Mercer M18300
2.90$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

79
Rosewood Handle Kitchen Utensil - Large Square Turner, 4" 

x 2"

Hubert                       

39935
5

 $8.19             

Mundial 4686M 
 $                11.90 

$10.38              

Dexter S242PCP
2.78$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 Stock Pot, 16 oz
Hubert                        

36498
2

 $36.47             

Alegacy EW16 

 $33.10             

Browne 5813116 

$20.41                  

Update APT-16
24.44$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

81 Stock Pot Cover
Hubert                            

67108
2

 $7.12           

Alegacy EWC10 

 $8.75               

Browne 5815016 

$3.83              

Update                  

APTC-10

3.92$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

82 Urn Cup, Capacity: 0.5 qt
Hubert                                 

96722
5

 $1.86             

Update                 

AMEA-05 

 $2.70            

Winco AM-05 

$2.49                      

Update                 

AMEA-05

2.69$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

83 Urn Cup, Capacity: 1 qt
Hubert                        

79927
5

 $2.48            

Update               

AMEA-10 

 $3.75              

Winco AM-1 

$2.78                

Winco AM-1
3.75$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 Urn Cup, Capacity: 2 qt
Hubert                            

61989
5

 $4.80           

Update           

AMEA-20 

 $5.90                 

Winco AM-2 

$4.35              

Winco AM-2
5.87$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

85 Urn Cup, Capacity: 4 qt
Hubert                            

51374
5

 $7.93            

Update            

AMEA-40 

 $9.90            

Winco AM-4 

$7.33         

Winco AM-4
9.90$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

86 Measuring Spoons, Heavy Duty Flat Handle
Hubert                                 

62421
20

 $1.50                

Thunder 

SLMC2416 

 $2.95            

American 

Metalcraft 

MSSF75 

$1.19            

Winco                   

MSPD-4X

1.60$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

87 Measuring Cups, Standard Strip Handle
Hubert                              

71793
20

 $2.89                   

Tablecraft 724 

 $3.70            

Tablecraft 724 

$7.72            

Focus 

Foodservice 864

2.36$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 Softgrip Combination Zester/Channel Tool, 6 1/2"
Hubert                       

71793
3

 $7.73         

Paderno       

48280-92 

 No Bid 
$7.12         

Browne 574442
2.50$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

89 Medium Weight Terry Cloth Oven Sleeve, 16"
Jomac                                 

82463
10

 $17.25         

Tucker 59500 

 $5.95                          

San Jamar 

SLWT16 

No Bid 2.89$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 Kevlar Oven Sleeve - Standard Sleeve
Jomac                                

50499
50

 $24.80         

Tucker 09500 

 $5.95                        

San Jamar SLK16 
No Bid 6.27$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

91 Kevlar Oven Sleeve - Sleeve with Thumb Hole
Jomac                              

57344
50

 $24.80          

Tucker 09500 

 $10.75                         

FMP 133-1600 
No Bid 6.84$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

92 Egg Slicer
Matfer Bourgeat                 

54080
10

 $2.40             

Update ES-AL 

 $3.30               

Update ES-AL 

$3.87          

Browne 230
3.58$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

93
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/2", Red, Capacity: 

Individual

San Jamar                        

90972
20 33.20$               

 $38.95              

San Jamar 

CBG182412RD 

33.55$               33.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

94
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/3", Yellow, Capacity: 

Individual

San Jamar                        

90972
20 33.20$               

 $38.95                    

San Jamar 

CBG182412YL 

33.55$               33.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

95
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/4", Green Brown, 

Capacity: Individual

San Jamar                        

90972
20 33.20$               

 $38.95                  

San Jamar 

CBG182412GN 

33.55$               33.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

96
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/5", Blue, Capacity: 

Individual

San Jamar                        

90972
20 33.20$               

 $38.95                       

San Jamar       

CBG182412BL 

33.55$               33.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

97
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/6", White, Capacity: 

Individual

San Jamar                        

90972
20 33.20$               

 $38.95            

San Jamar 

CBG182412WH 

33.55$               33.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

98
Saf-T-Grip Cutting Boards, 18" x 24" x 1/7", Multi, Capacity: 6-

Board Set

San Jamar                        

49137
5 183.00$             

 $217.00            

San Jamar 

CBG1824KC 

145.69$             187.03$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

99 Dial Oven Thermometer, 2 1/2" x 2 3/4", Stainless Steel
Taylor                                

85792
50 4.97$                 

 $5.60                   

Taylor 5932 

 $3.72              

Cooper-Atkins 

24HP-01-1 

2.49$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 All-Purpose Kitchen Shear, 4" blade
Victorinox                         

81154
30 12.39$               

 $13.90                 

Victorinox 87771 
11.97$               2.94$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

101 Vita-Prep 3 Blender
Vitamix                               

42164
5 485.00$             

 $549.00                

Vitamix 1005 
495.97$             380.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

102
Color-Coded Kool-Touch Ladle, 10", Black, Capacity: 1 oz 

cap

Vollrath                               

42164
10 9.47$                 

 $9.15              

Vollrath 58011 
8.95$                 9.41$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

103
Color-Coded Kool-Touch Ladle, 9 7/8", blue, Capacity: 2 oz 

cap

Vollrath                     

91214
1 10.40$               

 $10.05             

Vollrath 58322 
9.83$                 10.01$          No Bid No Bid No Bid
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104
Color-Coded Kool-Touch Ladle, 12 3/8", Orange, Capacity: 8 

oz cap

Vollrath                    

59339
10 14.08$               

 $13.60        

Vollrath 58366 
14.72$               13.82$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

105
One-Piece Color-Coded Disher, 4", Orange, Capacity: 8 oz 

cap

Vollrath                         

74660
20 14.49$               

 $14.00       

Vollrath 47388 
13.70$               7.34$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

106 One-Piece Color-Coded Disher, 5", Teal, Capacity: 6 oz cap
Vollrath                                 

49600
20 14.49$               

 $14.00       

Vollrath 47389 
13.70$               7.34$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

107
One-Piece Color-Coded Disher, 6", White, Capacity: 4 3/4 oz 

cap

Vollrath                           

33498
20 9.99$                 

 $9.65                

Vollrath 47390 
9.44$                 6.93$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

108
One-Piece Color-Coded Disher, 8", Grey, Capacity: 3 3/4 oz 

cap

Vollrath                                 

36345
50 9.99$                 

 $9.65            

Vollrath 47391 
9.44$                 6.93$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

109 Batter Boss, 6 1/8" x 10 7/8" x 7 1/2", Capacity: 48 oz
Vollrath                              

72333
2 88.04$               

 $89.75           

Vollrath 2803-18 
87.80$               82.39$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

110 Aluminum Colander, 15" x 5 3/4", Capacity: 11 qt
Vollrath                       

21084
5 78.14$               

 $75.50               

Vollrath 68298 
73.86$               39.71$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

111 Aluminum Colander, 16 1/2" x 7 1/4", Capacity: 16 qt
Vollrath                           

20990
5 81.28$               

 $82.85                 

Vollrath 68350 
81.05$               39.48$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

112 Heavy-Duty Scalloped Utility Tongs, 7" 
Vollrath                               

51796
25 1.66$                 

 $2.15               

Vollrath 47007 
1.57$                 1.47$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

113 Heavy-Duty Scalloped Utility Tongs, 9 1/2"
Vollrath                    

40574
25 2.54$                 

 $2.45                

Vollrath 47309 
2.40$                 1.74$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

114 Heavy-Duty Scalloped Utility Tongs, 12"
Vollrath                                  

51642
25 3.36$                 

 $3.25                 

Vollrath 47312 
3.18$                 2.08$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

115 Heavy-Duty Scalloped Utility Tongs, 16"
Vollrath                             

74116
25 3.36$                 

 $4.10                    

Vollrath 47316 
4.01$                 2.40$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

116
Perforated Super Pan V, 20 3/4" x 12 3/4" x 4", Capacity: Full 

Size

Vollrath                       

20043
20 37.67$               

 $36.40       

Vollrasth 30043 
35.61$               33.42$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

117
Perforated Super Pan V, 12 5/8" x 10 3/8" x 4", Capacity: Half 

Size

Vollrath                           

20243
10 24.68$               

 $23.85     

Vollrath 30243 
23.33$               21.89$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

118
Wear-Ever Aluminum Fry Pan with PowerCoat2 Interior, 25 

1/8" x 14" x 2 3/4", Silicone Handle

Vollrath                           

41209
3 38.55$               

 $39.30        

Vollrath 67814 
38.45$               46.44$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

119 Wear-Ever Aluminum Fry Pan Cover, 14 5/8"
Vollrath                       

24465
3 15.11$               

 $15.40     

Vollrath 67541 
15.07$               14.48$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

120 High-Temperature Softspoon, 13 1/2"
Vollrath                                 

54481
15 9.07$                 

 $8.40        

Vollrath 58123 
8.22$                 7.71$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

121 Plastic Softspoon, 9 1/2"
Vollrath                          

68372
25 1.67$                 

 $1.80            

Vollrath 52109 
1.52$                 1.42$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

122 Plastic Softspoon, 13 5/8"
Vollrath                     

69783
25 2.38$                 

 $2.55        

Vollrath 52113 
2.15$                 2.02$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

123 Plastic Softspoon, 16 1/2"
Vollrath                     

62439
25 3.02$                 

 $3.25       

Vollrath 52116 
2.74$                 2.57$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

124 Plate & Bowl Scraper, 5 1/8" x 3 7/8"
Vollrath                      

27721
25 0.92$                 

 $1.00         

Winco PDS-5 
0.93$                 0.87$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

125 Aluminum Saute Pan - silicone handle, 3 qt
Wear-Ever                         

84086
3

 $31.16          

Vollrath 67733 

 $31.75          

Vollrath 67733 
28.22$               26.48$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

126 Aluminum Saute Pan - silicone handle, 5 qt
Wear-Ever                      

79236
3

 $36.56              

Vollrath 67735 

 $37.20           

Vollrath 67735 
33.11$               31.07$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

127 Aluminum Saute Pan - silicone handle, 7 1/2 qt
Wear-Ever                      

38326
3

 $41.69         

Vollrath 67737 

 $42.45      

Vollrath 67737 
37.76$               35.43$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

128 Aluminum Saute Pan - cover, 3 qt
Wear-Ever                            

43390
3

 $10.85         

Vollrath 67509 

 $16.50        

Vollrath 67320 
9.83$                 9.23$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

129 Aluminum Saute Pan - cover, 5 qt
Wear-Ever                

33052
3

 $12.91        

Vollrath 67521 

 $13.15     

Vollrath 67521 
11.69$               10.97$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

130 Aluminum Saute Pan - cover, 7 1/2 qt
Wear-Ever                          

24465
3

 $16.63             

Vollrath 67541 

 $16.95             

Vollrath 67541 
15.07$               14.14$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

131 PRO Cutlery - Paring Knife, 3 1/2"
Wusthof                              

53796
10 5.83$                 

 $7.30        

Wusthof 4851-

7/09 

5.28$                 5.20$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

132 PRO Cutlery - Offset Bread Knife, 9"
Wusthof                             

59821
20 18.95$               

 $23.70       

Wusthof 4855-7 
17.17$               17.68$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

133 PRO Cutlery - Cook's Knife, 8"
Wusthof                               

72167
20 26.73$               

 $33.45  Wusthof 

4862-7/20 
24.21$               16.12$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

134 PRO Cutlery - Cook's Knife, 10"
Wusthof                                  

78002
20 31.59$               

 $39.50         

Wusthof 4862-

7/26 

28.61$               24.13$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

135 Sharpening Steel, 14 1/2"
Wusthof                               

69755
6 37.91$               

 $24.30      

Wusthof 4473 
34.34$               26.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

136 Hand Operated Comfort Grip Can Opener
Hubert                                           

87541
30

 $7.06               

Focus 709BK 

 $8.60         Focus 

709BK 

 $6.68                

Focus 

Foodservice 

709BK 

6.63$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

137 4" Dia 6-Wheel Portion Control Cutter, 11" x 4 1/5"
Hubert                                             

43146
2

 $20.70          

Alegacy 7226 
 No Bid 

 $17.40                  

Update               

MWDC-6 

15.72$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

138 Premium Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls
Hubert                                       

49471
5

 $10.63                   

Alegacy 8873 

 $19.00   

Tablecraft H832 

 $8.36           

Browne 575903 
25.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

139 Premium Stainless Steel Mixing Bowls, 6 qt 
Hubert                                      

65792
5

 $17.88        

Alegacy S876 

 $15.60         

Browne 575906 

 $11.44         

Browne 575906 
30.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid
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East Bay 

Restaurant 

Supply

Plastic 

Package, 

Inc.

Sunrise 

Packaging 

Products, 

Inc.

The 

Platinum 

Packaging 

Group

1 Solid Color 3-Pocket Bib Aprons, 24" x 28", Royal Blue
ChefWorks                                

83876    
50 No Bid No Bid 8.00$                 11.65$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Film, 80 Gauge Hot, 12" 
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00/lb

3 Film, 80 Gauge Hot, 14 1/2"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00/lb

4 Film, 80 Gauge Hot, 15 1/2"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00/lb

5 Film, 80 Gauge Hot Perforated , 13 1/2"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85/lb

6 Film, 80 Gauge Hot Perforated, 14 1/2" 
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85/lb

7 Film, 100 Gauge Cold, 10"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.95/lb   

Plastic 

Supplies - 

Amtorp

$2.00/lb

8 Film, 100 Gauge Cold, 12"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.95/lb   

Plastic 

Supplies - 

Amtorp

$2.00/lb

9 Film, 100 Gauge Cold, 13 1/2"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.95/lb   

Plastic 

Supplies - 

Amtorp

$2.00/lb

10 Film, 100 Gauge Cold, 13"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.95/lb   

Plastic 

Supplies - 

Amtorp

$2.00/lb

11 Film, 100 Gauge Cold, 15 1/2"
Platinum Packaging       

Platseal
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.95/lb   

Plastic 

Supplies - 

Amtorp

$2.00/lb

12 Tall Container, Black 
Platinum Packaging                        

PT108-BB
40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 78.89$       

13
Low Density Food Grade Polyethylene Bags, 6" x 8 3/4" x 1 

1/2"

Sunrise Packaging                       

BBB68NV
20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 120.00$      No Bid

14 Produce Tape Bag Sealers
Sunrise Packaging               

EZTS2333 
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 250.00$      No Bid

15 Lidding film type 1153, 4-5/8" x 2800' Sunrise Packaging 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 125.00$      $50.00/roll

16 Cleaning Tablets, Bucket of 100
Rational                              

4596 
5 No Bid No Bid 77.41$               56.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Care Tablets, Bucket of 100 packets
Rational                              

24215 
5 No Bid No Bid 120.00$             89.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 Produce Wash, 5 Gal
FIT                               

26941 
5 No Bid No Bid 162.00$             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Cell hot deep tray, sealable @ 2500/cs
Plastic Package              

4551-8
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 241.68$   No Bid No Bid

Item 

No.
Description

Manufacturer &      

Model No.
Qty Action Sales

Arrow 

Restaurant 

Equipment & 

Supplies Inc.

Chefs' Toys

East Bay 

Restaurant 

Supply

Plastic 

Package, 

Inc.

Sunrise 

Packaging 

Products, 

Inc.

The 

Platinum 

Packaging 

Group

1 No Bid 55% 30% 50/10% No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 No Bid 64% 30% 50/10% No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 No Bid 52% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 No Bid 52% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 No Bid Price Varies TBD 10% 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 No Bid 50% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 No Bid 50% 30% 50/5% No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 No Bid 50% 30% 50/10% No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 No Bid 
Spec Series 55/ 

Dealer Choice 66
30% 50/5% No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 No Bid 55% 30% 50/5% No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 No Bid 64% 30% 50/10% No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 No Bid 30% 10% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 No Bid 55% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 No Bid 45% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 45% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other Cambro: Non-Specified Items

Other Cooper Atkins: Non-Specified Items

Other FIFO: Non-Specified Items

Other Vollrath: Non-Specified Items

Other True: Non-Specified Items

Other BurnGuard: Non-Specified Items

Other Panasonic: Non-Specified Items

Other Sunrise Packaging: Non-Specified Items

Other Traulsen: Non-Specified Items

Other G.A. Systems: Non-Specified Items

Other Globe: Non-Specified Items

Other Metro: Non-Specified Items

Other Beverage Air: Non-Specified Items

Other Blodgett: Non-Specified Items

Other Crescor: Non-Specified Items

Accessories

Catalog Percentage (%) Discounts

Other Advance Tabco: Non-Specified Items
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Bid No. 15/16-03NS, Kitchen Equipment, Smallwares Accessories

Bid Matrix

Line # Description
Manufacturer &      

Model No.

Est. 

Qty
Action Sales

Arrow 

Restaurant 

Equipment & 

Supplies Inc.

Chefs' Toys

East Bay 

Restaurant 

Supply

Plastic 

Package, 

Inc.

Sunrise 

Packaging 

Products, 

Inc.

The 

Platinum 

Packaging 

Group

17 No Bid 50% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 No Bid No Bid No Bid NET No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 30% No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 No Bid 30% 30% 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 No Bid 45% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 No Bid 30% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 No Bid 45% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 No Bid 50% 30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 No Bid 
55% Division of 

Vollrath
30% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 No Bid 30% 10% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 No Bid No Bid 10% 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 No Bid 
25% Equipment 

Only
10% 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 No Bid 30% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Note:  

- Identical bid price line items were awarded to vendor(s) in accordance with Public Contract Code 20117

- Catalog Discounts refers to Manufacturer list pricing

- Items not bid as specified in the bid documents were awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder

Other Plastic Package: Non-Specified Items

Submitting Vendor Catalog if Not Specified Above

- Yellow highlight represents awarded items to each vendor

- Large Equipment: bid line item No. 9 and Catalog Percentage Discounts: bid line Nos. 9, 19, 29, 31, and 32 will not be awarded and have been removed from the bid 

Other FIT: Non-Specified Items

Other Jomac: Non-Specified Items

Other Matfer Bourgeat: Non-Specified Items

Other San Jamar: Non-Specified Items

Other Taylor: Non-Specified Items

Other Victorinox: Non-Specified Items

Other Vitamix: Non-Specified Items

Other Wear-Ever: Non-Specified Items

Other Wusthof: Non-Specified Items

Other ChefWorks: Non-Specified Items

Other Platinum Packaging: Non-Specified Items

Other Rational: Non-Specified Items

Other Focus Foodservice: Non-Specified Items

Other Good Grip: Non-Specified Items

Other Hubert: Non-Specified Items
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